

LAWRENCE COUNTY COMMISSIONERS MEETING – September 5, 2023 page-1

Chairman Robert Ewing called the regular meeting of the Lawrence County Commissioners to order and the Pledge of Allegiance was conducted at 8:00 a.m. on September 5, 2023 in the Administrative Annex Building of the Lawrence County Courthouse located at 90 Sherman Street, Deadwood, SD with Commissioners Brandon Flanagan, Randy Deibert and Eric Jennings. Absent-Commissioner Richard Sleep.

All motions were passed by unanimous vote, by all members present, unless stated otherwise.

AGENDA: Moved-Seconded (Deibert-Flanagan) to approve the agenda as amended. Motion Carried.

DECLARE CONFLICTS: Commission Ewing declared a conflict with the 10:15 a.m. agenda item: Conditional Use Permit #487/Larson Family, LLP.

MINUTES: Moved-Seconded (Flanagan-Deibert) to approve the minutes of August 22, 2023 County Commission meeting. Motion Carried.

PERSONNEL:

SHERIFF: Moved-Seconded (Deibert-Ewing) to approve Laurel Palmer (Multi-role employee) as a part-time fill-in Correctional Officer II G1 at a base rate of \$22.53 per hour, effective September 5, 2023. Motion Carried.

Moved-Seconded (Deibert-Flanagan) to approve the classification change for Vanessa Adrain as a full-time permanent Correctional Officer II G3 at a base rate of \$23.46 per hour, effective September 10, 2023. Motion Carried.

Moved-Seconded (Deibert-Flanagan) to approve the step raise for Kendale Shain as a full-time permanent Correctional Officer II G1 at a base rate of \$22.53 per hour, effective September 10, 2023. Motion Carried.

Moved-Seconded (Deibert-Flanagan) to approve the step raise for Krista Kerutis as a full-time permanent Correctional Officer II G2 at a base rate of \$23.00 per hour, effective September 10, 2023. Motion Carried.

Moved-Seconded (Deibert-Flanagan) to approve the step raise for Monica Lucio as a full-time permanent Correctional Sergeant G3 at a base rate of \$25.14 per hour, effective September 10, 2023. Motion Carried.

Moved-Seconded (Deibert-Flanagan) to approve the step raise for Brandon Rosenau as a full-time permanent Deputy II G 3 at a base rate of \$29.98 per hour, effective September 24, 2023. Motion Carried.

Moved-Seconded (Flanagan-Jennings) to approve the new hire for Brandon Olson as a full-time permanent Correctional Officer I G1 at a base rate of \$21.23 per hour, effective September 11, 2023. Motion Carried.

Moved-Seconded (Jennings-Flanagan) to approve the new hire for Katie Kindsfater as a part-time fill-in Dispatcher I G1 at a base rate of \$21.23 per hour, effective September 5, 2023. Motion Carried.

Moved-Seconded (Deibert-Jennings) to approve the new hire for Miya Cole as a full-time permanent Correctional Officer I G1 at a base rate of \$21.23 per hour, effective September 11, 2023. Motion Carried.

TRAVEL REQUEST:

PLANNING & ZONING: Moved-Seconded (Flanagan-Jennings) to amend the travel request for Amber Vogt to attend the 2023 Western Planner Conference in Anchorage, AK from September 18-22, 2023 and allow for a travel advance. Motion Carried.

AUDITOR'S ACCOUNT WITH TREASURER REPORT: Moved-Seconded (Flanagan-Jennings) to accept the Auditor's Account with the County Treasurer. Motion Carried. As of August 31, 2023, showed the following: Total amount of actual cash-\$1,350.00; total amount of checks and drafts in Treasurer's possession not exceeding three days (check deposit in transit)-

\$41,824.87; total amount of cash in transit in Treasurer's possession (cash deposit in transit)- \$5,516.92; petty cash-\$2,725.00; total amount of deposits in bank include: CD's \$5,000,000.00; bank balance \$26,212,902.06; US Bank balance \$23,212,926.24; money market \$1,626,175.11. Total \$56,103,420.20. Motion Carried.

2024 LOCAL EMERGENCY MANAGEMENT PERFORMANCE GRANT: Paul Thomson, Emergency Management Director, presented the 2024 Local Emergency Management Performance Grant and discussed the changes.

Moved-Seconded (Flanagan-Jennings) to approve and authorize the Chairman to sign the 2024 Local Emergency Management Performance Grant. Motion Carried.

AUTOMATIC SUPPLEMENTS:

SHERIFF: Moved-Seconded (Flanagan-Deibert) to approve the automatic supplement of \$969.35 to the Sheriff Travel Budget for insurance proceeds payment supplement. Motion Carried.

LEAD FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT BOARD: Moved-Seconded (Jennings-Ewing) to appoint Ron Moeller pursuant to SDCL 34-31A15.1 effective August 31, 2023 to replace Oz Enderby who resigned effective August 31, 2023. Motion Carried.

Moved-Seconded (Jennings-Ewing) to appoint Austine Wilson pursuant to SDCL 34-31A15.1 effective August 31, 2023 to replace Steven (Stu) Stewart who resigned effective August 31, 2023. Motion Carried.

SHERIFF:

PUBLIC SAFETY & SERVICES CENTER: Brian Dean, Sheriff, gave an update on the Public Safety and Services Center regarding the cinder block walls and exterior walls.

Commissioner Deibert reported on behalf of the work group that was tasked to address the request for an easement to the Larissa Properties, LTD parcel lying adjacent to the new Public Safety & Services Center. Deibert stated that SD DOT issued an approach permit from US Highway 85. Deibert added that the work group is still working on a possible utility easement for the parcel.

VEHICLE BIDS: Moved-Seconded (Deibert-Flanagan) to set the bid opening for four (4) patrol vehicles model year 2024 on September 26, 2023 at 8:15 a.m. contingent upon the approval of the 2024 Budget. Motion Carried.

ORDINANCE #2023-01/AN ORDINANCE PROHIBITING JUMPING OR DIVING FROM BRIDGES: First Reading was held on the proposed ordinance #2023-01 an ordinance prohibiting jumping or diving from bridges.

Bruce Outka, Deputy State's Attorney, and Brian Dean, Sheriff, presented the ordinance prohibiting jumping or diving from bridges.

Outka stated that an emergency clause has been placed on this ordinance and will take effect immediately after the second reading on September 26, 2023.

Dean stated that due to traffic, water depths and practices becoming more extreme, safety is an issue.

Second reading and adoption scheduled for September 26, 2023 at 8:15 a.m.

HIGHWAY:

FUEL QUOTES: The following fuel quote was submitted as of August 22, 2023 and September 5, 2023: **Deadwood Diesel #2 (dyed) 8000 gallons:** (prices per gallon) CBH Cooperative – \$3.498**; Olson Fuels – No Bid; MG Oil – \$3.75. **Deadwood Unleaded 4500 gallons:** (prices per gallon) CBH Cooperative – \$3.52; Olson Fuels – No Bid; MG Oil –\$3.44**. **Spearfish Unleaded 900 gallons:** (prices per gallon) CBH Cooperative – \$3.494; Olson Fuels – \$3.395**; MG Oil –No Bid. **Whitewood Diesel #2 (dyed) 900 gallons:** (prices per gallon) CBH Cooperative – \$3.498**; Olson Fuels – No Bid; MG Oil – \$3.75. **Represents accepted quote.

PERMITS:

LUMEN TECHNOLOGIES: Moved-Seconded (Deibert-Flanagan) to follow the recommendation of John Bey, Highway Superintendent, and approve the utility permit for Lumen

Technologies to install underground facilities along S Rapid Creek Road approximately .3 miles from Retreat Road for construction of a phone line beginning in Section 34 T3N, R1E and ending in Section 34, T3N, R1E and approve the permit to occupy County Highway Right-of-Way submitted by Lumen Technologies located in Section 34, T3N, R1E along County Road: S Rapid Creek Road, to install a phone line. Clarification of Dimensions for Ordinance #07-01. Approval upon the condition that: 1. The Depth is no less than 36 inches the full length of the excavation and the depth is closely monitored. 2. The location of the excavation is as far as possible away from the edge of the road. This is to protect your utility from future disturbances such as drainage repairs, or road surface expansion. The 36-inch depth and the 5-foot clearance measurement in our current ordinance is only a minimum and should only be allowed if there is proof that the maximum depth and clearance is not possible. Aye-Flanagan, Deibert and Ewing. Nay-Jennings. Motion Carried.

GARDNER: Moved-Seconded (Flanagan-Deibert) to follow the recommendation of John Bey, Highway Superintendent, and approve the private approach permit for Kenneth Gardner to construct a private approach on the north side of Yellow Creek Road located across from Tri City Rubble Site with the condition that the current approach be abandoned after the new one is in place. Motion Carried.

TEMPORARY EASEMENT/AGREEMENT FOR VOLUNTARY RIGHT-OF-WAY DONATION PROJECT NO: BRO 8041 (184) PCN 0854/41-079-199: Moved-Seconded (Deibert-Jennings) to approve and authorize the Chairman to sign the Temporary Easement Agreement for Voluntary Right-of-Way donation between Lawrence County and REDJAC, LLC or Adam Redlinger. Motion Carried.

AGREEMENT FOR RIGHT-OF-WAY ACQUISITION BY ESTABLISHED PAYMENT BRF-B6545(04) PCN 08NO/41-228-112: Moved-Seconded (Flanagan-Deibert) to approve and authorize the Chairman to sign the Agreement for Right-of-Way acquisition approving payment from Lawrence County to Arthur & Eloise Daniels in the amount of \$680.00. Motion Carried.

Moved-Seconded (Flanagan-Deibert) to approve and authorize the Chairman to sign the Agreement for Right-of-Way acquisition approving payment from Lawrence County to Michael & Susan Davies in the amount of \$545.00. Motion Carried.

PROJECT UPDATES: John Bey, Highway Superintendent, gave an update on the Nemo Bridge Preservation, North St. Onge Bridge, South St. Onge Bridge and South Rapid Creek Road.

John Bey, Highway Superintendent, asked the commission for guidance on signing on the South Rapid Creek Road.

Moved-Seconded (Flanagan-Ewing)) to follow the recommendation of John Bey, Highway Superintendent, and install no signage signs and install stop signs at the cross roads on South Rapid Creek Road. Motion Carried.

MASTER TRANSPORTATION PLAN SCOPE OF WORK: John Bey, Highway Superintendent, gave an overview of the meeting that was held on Thursday, August, 17, 2023 at 8:00 a.m. in reference to the Lawrence County Master Transportation Plan.

PERSONNEL:

EXECUTIVE SESSION PERSONNEL: 8:34 a.m. Moved-Seconded (Deibert-Flanagan) to go into executive session pursuant to SDCL 1-25-2(1) for discussing the qualifications, competence, performance, character or fitness of any public officer or employee or prospective public officer or employee. The term, employee, does not include any independent contractor. Motion Carried. 8:57 a.m. The Board opened for regular business with no action taken.

EQUALIZATION: Moved-Seconded (Deibert-Jennings) to approve the step raise for Brett Runge as a full-time permanent Director of Equalization at a base rate of \$2,940.00 per pay period, hour, effective August 27, 2023. Motion Carried.

FIVE-YEAR COUNTY HIGHWAY AND BRIDGE IMPROVEMENT PLAN: At 9:00 a.m. a Public Meeting was held on the five-year Lawrence County Highway and Bridge Improvement Plan. Seven members from the public attended the meeting and no public input was given.

John Bey, Highway Superintendent, presented and reviewed the proposed five-year County Highway and Bridge Improvement Plan with the Commissioners and those in attendance from the public.

PLANNING & ZONING:

PRELIMINARY PLAT/WINSELL: APPLICANT: Dennis and Dorothy Winsell LEGAL DESCRIPTION: Lots A, B, C, D, E, F and Green Space Tract W of Spring Run Estates Section 16, T4N, R4E (legal shortened) VICINITY LOCATION: Elk Creek Road SUMMARY: New Lots (original prelim for this sub approved 2019, but has since expired) ZONING: PF.

Amber Vogt, Planning & Zoning Administrator, presented her staff report.

Moved-Seconded (Flanagan-Deibert) to approve the preliminary plat for APPLICANT Dennis and Dorothy Winsell based upon the Planning and Zoning Commission recommendation for approval and the concurrent recommendation of P&Z staff, as reflected in the staff report. LEGAL DESCRIPTION: Lots A, B, C, D, E, F and Green Space Tract W of Spring Run Estates Section 16, T4N, R4E (legal shortened) VICINITY LOCATION: Elk Creek Road SUMMARY: New Lots (original prelim for this sub approved 2019, but has since expired) ZONING: PF. Motion Carried.

INTERPRETATION OF RESIDENTIAL HEIGHT REGULATIONS/DINGEMAN: Amber Vogt, Planning & Zoning Administrator, asked the board for guidance on the interpretation of residential height regulations and presented her staff report.

Moved-Seconded (Deibert-Ewing) to have the Planning & Zoning Director accept the IBC code interpretation for height restriction for this application. Motion Carried.

2024 BUDGET: A public hearing was held on the proposed 2024 budget.

No public input was voiced and the public hearing was closed.

Commissioner Deibert pointed out that recently there has been an information request for the Auditor on the budget. Deibert reiterated that the commission has a budget workshop that is part of the normal commission meeting where the board goes through every line item in the budget. Deibert pointed out that he did not see anyone at those meetings and it is a labor stress to have these information requests after the fact when the commission has already had the public meetings. Deibert encouraged the public to attend these meetings if they want to engage and avoid duplicating labor efforts in our departments.

Moved-Seconded (Deibert-Flanagan) to add a one-time bonus to the Treasurer and Auditor in the amount of \$7,500.00 each. Motion Carried.

The Board will consider adoption of the budget at the September 26, 2023 meeting.

PLANNING & ZONING:

TEMPORARY USE PERMIT #23-02/TETRUALT: Monique & Thane Tetrault 11673 Tetrault Road, St. Onge request for a Temporary Use pursuant to Section 10.007 to allow an existing mobile home to be used until the new stick built residence is built and (6 months to remove the mobile home from the issuance of the occupancy permit) and request for a waiver of the \$250 application fee.

Amber Vogt, Planning & Zoning Administrator, presented her staff report.

Moved-Seconded (Deibert-Flanagan) to approve the Temporary Use Permit #23-02 as submitted for Monique & Thane Tetrault LEGAL DESCRIPTION: NW1/4 NE1/4 - W1/2 NE1/4 NE1/4 35-007-03 with a 24 month construction time, 6 month removal of mobile home once occupancy permit is issued and to waive the \$250.00 application fee. Motion Carried.

PETITION FOR VACATION OF SECTION LINE/HIGHWAY/RIGHT-OF-WAY/

STRASBAUGH: A Public Hearing was held on a Petition for Vacation of Section Line Right-of-Way LEGAL DESCRIPTION FOR THE VACATION: EXHIBIT DRAWING FOR SECTION LINE R.O.W. VACATION - ACROSS TRACT 72A BEING PORTIONS OF TRACT 72 AND 73 AND LAST CHANCE M.S. 1775; TRACT 1, BEING A PORTION OF CONNECTING M.S. 1888; LOT 5 OF THE DOLPHIN TRACT REVISED FORMERLY KNOWN AS THE

DOLPHIN TRACT, BEING PORTIONS OF FORTUNA M.S. 1783, DOLPHIN, WHALE, TIGER AND ALL OF COMSTOCK M.S.1598, A PORTION OF GOV'T LOT 11 OF SECTION 10 AND A PORTION OF GOV'T LOT 1 OF SECTION 15. ALL LOCATED IN THE SW1/4, SE1/4 OF SECTION 10 AND THE NW1/4, NE1/4 OF SECTION 15, T4N, R3E, B.H.M. LAWRENCE COUNTY, SOUTH DAKOTA AFFECTING THE LANDOWNERS: Nathan Strasbaugh

Brenda McGruder, Auditor, presented Lawrence County Resolution #2023-18, Resolution & Order to Vacate a Portion of a Highway, Part of Which Is Located on a Section Line/ Highway/ Right of Way.

No public input was voiced and the public hearing was closed.

Commissioner Deibert asked for clarification on whether the owner of Comstock M.S. 1598 needs to sign the petition.

Moved-Seconded (Flanagan-Jennings) to continue Lawrence County Resolution #2023-18, Resolution & Order to Vacate a Portion of a Highway, Part of Which Is Located on a Section Line/Highway/Right of Way. Motion Carried.

SPEARFISH COMPREHENSIVE PLAN GROUP: Moved-Seconded (Deibert-Jennings) to appoint Commissioner Flanagan to the Spearfish Comprehensive Plan Group. Motion Carried.

PLANNING & ZONING:

CONDITIONAL USE PERMIT #484/GF DEVELOPMENT, LLC./NORTH STAR CONSTRUCTION, INC.-HAUL ROAD AND OPERATING AGREEMENT AND DUST CONTROL PLAN: Conditional Use Permit #484 OWNER/APPLICANT: GF Development, LLC/North Star Construction, Inc. LEGAL DESCRIPTION: S ½ SE ¼ & SE ¼ SW ¼ of Section 34, T7N, R1E and N ½ of Govt Lot 1 & part of Govt Lot 2 lying North of Homestake Rd Section 3, T6N, R1E VICINITY LOCATION: Homestake Road SUMMARY: Small Scale Gravel Pit ZONING: A-1 ACREAGE: 81.00 acres.

John Bey, Highway Superintendent, gave an overview of the estimate from Brosz Engineering to inspect the structures on the Homestake Road. Also discussed were weight limits and speed limits on the Homestake Road. The intersections of Homestake Road and Crow Peak Bench Road and the Homestake Road and Red Hill Road were also discussed. The final piece of the discussion was the sur-charge per ton for all rock product hauled from the quarry.

The Board discussed the replacement of bridges, the sur-charge per ton for all rock product hauled from the quarry, left hand turn out of the quarry, identification markings on the haul trucks, history of Homestake Road and the use of the road to haul product to the mill, modification of the proposed Haul Road and Operating Agreement, bridge inspection, speed limits, weight limits, dust control, replacement of the berm by the applicant if a right hand turn is allowed.

Kyle Vavruska, 10100 Red Hill Place, Spearfish commented that if a right turn is not allowed it would be added cost to the customer.

Amber Vogt, stated that no complaints have been received from the Edward's Pit since its approval in 2016, but she predicts her office will now start receiving complaints. Vogt cautioned that the discussion should not be about comparing the draft agreements with the 2 pending pits to the Edward's Pit agreement. Vogt added that the agreement can be amended when complaints are received.

Regarding the suggestion that special permits be issued to truckers hauling from the proposed pits, JR Baker, 10519 Homestake Road, Spearfish suggested that both the truckers and the County would soon find themselves buried in paperwork and law enforcement involvement.

TJ Ewing, 6455 Pendo Road, Spearfish, reported that a 10 yard mixer would be approximately 79,000 pounds.

Commissioner Flanagan proposed a work group be put together to bring suggestions back to the board.

TJ Ewing presented information on the SD DOT size and weight regulations and examples of gross weight limits.

10:45 a.m. Chairman Ewing turned the meeting over to Vice-Chairman Flanagan and left the table.

CONDITIONAL USE PERMIT #487/LARSON FAMILY, LLP.-HAUL ROAD AND OPERATING AGREEMENT AND DUST CONTROL PLAN: Conditional Use Permit #487
OWNER/APPLICANT: Larson Family, LLP LEGAL DESCRIPTION: S ½ SE ¼ of Section 35, T7B, R1E and NE ¼ of Section 2, T6N, R1E VICINITY LOCATION: Spearfish/Off Homestake Road SUMMARY: Small Scale Gravel Pit ZONING: A-1 ACREAGE: 129.60 acres.

John Bey, Highway Superintendent, gave an overview of the estimate from Brosz Engineering to inspect the structures on the Homestake Road. Also discussed were weight limits and speed limits on the Homestake Road. The intersections of Homestake Road and Crow Peak Bench Road and the Homestake Road and Red Hill Road were also discussed. The final piece of the discussion was the sur-charge per ton for all rock product hauled from the quarry.

The Board discussed the replacement of bridges, the sur-charge per ton for all rock product hauled from the quarry, left hand turn out of the quarry, identification markings on the haul trucks, history of Homestake Road and the use of the road to haul product to the mill, modification of the proposed Haul Road and Operating Agreement, bridge inspection, speed limits, weight limits, dust control, replacement of the berm by the applicant if a right hand turn is allowed,

Commissioner Deibert commented on the loads per day compared to the other pits in the area and changing the haul route to the south.

10:51 a.m. Chairman Ewing returned to the table and took over the meeting.

TASK FORCE/ CONDITIONAL USE PERMIT #484/GF DEVELOPMENT, LLC./NORTH STAR CONSTRUCTION, INC. & CONDITIONAL USE PERMIT #487/LARSON FAMILY, LLP.: Moved-Seconded (Flanagan-Deibert) to appoint a task force to include: The Applicants, Highway Superintendent John Bey, P&Z Staff, Bruce Outka, Deputy State's Attorney, Commissioner Deibert, Commissioner Jennings, Kyle Vavruska, independent contractor, Brian Dean, Sheriff and Les Turgeon, member of the public to discuss the Haul Road and Operating agreement and Dust Control agreement for CUP #484 and CUP #487 to be completed by the end of October, 2023. Aye-Flanagan, Deibert and Jennings. Nay-Ewing. Motion Carried.

USFS TINTON ROAD IMPROVEMENT FUNDING: Brandon Taglioli, USFS Assistant Forest Engineer, Valerie Jagim, Realty Specialist, and Lou Conroy, acting District Ranger, were present to give a status update on the Tinton Road improvements that were discussed at the March 28, 2023 commission meeting. Taglioli presented 3 options for the board to consider.

Moved-Seconded (Deibert-Ewing) to allow staff to review the FRTA Easement and bring back to the board for a final approval. Motion Carried.

NATURAL RESOURCES COMMITTEE:

USFS COOPERATING AGENCY STATUS/ZEPPELIN AND SPRUCE PROJECTS/ CHIMERA PROJECT COMMENTS: Bill Coburn, Mitch Iverson, Paul Pierson, Don Hausle, Sherry Bea Smith and Ron Moeller, Natural Resources Committee, were present to give an update on the USFS Cooperating Agency Status, Zeppelin and Spruce Projects and Chimera Project comments.

DAKOTA SOCIETY OF AMERICAN FORESTERS SYMPOSIUM: The Dakota Society of American Foresters Symposium will be held on October 3, 2023 at The Rushmore Hotel, Rapid City SD with registration beginning at 7:45 a.m.

ITEMS FROM THE PUBLIC: Erica Douglas, 3726 Spring Creek Lane, Spearfish spoke about hand counting ballots in Lawrence County and the machines that count the votes presently. Douglas stated that machines are getting smart and asked the Commission to consider strapping on the popularity cape and have Lawrence County hand count the votes.

Douglas also suggested that the county cease the permitting of cold storage. Douglas added that we are blessed to be the keeper of the Black Hills beauty and not grant the view of corrugated metal.

ITEMS FROM THE COMMISSIONERS: Commissioner Deibert gave an update on the agenda for the upcoming County Convention being held on September 12-13, 2023 in Sioux Falls.

BILLS: Commissioner Deibert commented that the Court Appointed Fees are at \$13,000.00.

Moved-Seconded (Deibert-Jennings) to approve payment of the following payroll and vouchers listed below for expenditures for insurance, professional services, publications, rentals, supplies, repairs, maintenance, travel, conference fees, utilities, furniture and equipment drawn on the proper funds and various departments. Motion Carried.

Payroll: Comm-\$7,842.51; Aud-\$13,594.56; Treas-\$16,459.03; States Atty-\$18,438.50; Pub Def-\$11,961.48; Gen Govt Bldg-\$11,558.04; Equal-\$17,380.16; Rod-\$10,973.42; Ist-\$8,928.43; Sher-\$62,639.73; Jail-\$40,201.06; Coroner-\$374.04; 24/7-\$519.82; Emerg Mgnt-\$5,082.53; E911-\$19,053.97; Highway-\$56,695.39; Weed-\$5,558.98; P&Z-\$8,799.73; **Bills:** Vogt, Amber-\$228.00; Johnson, Patrick-\$286.00; Maki, Christine-\$186.00; Steveson, Becky-\$45.90; A To Z Shredding-\$222.00; A&B Business,Inc Solutions-\$892.69; A&B Welding Supply-\$24.49; A&I Distributors-\$816.10; A&J Supply-\$6.42; Ace Hardware-\$17.99; Air Connection-\$296.23; Alpine Impressions-\$115.00; At&T Mobility-\$1,560.58; American Family Life-\$2,580.94; Deadwood Recreation Center-\$670.00; Delta Dental Of South Dakota-\$8,820.52; Dept Of The Treasury-\$74,159.52; Hartford-Priority Accounts-\$2,319.42; Midcontinent Communications-\$154.72; Northern Hills Rec Center-\$92.00; Office Of Child Support-\$478.16; Sd Retirement System-\$117,156.89; Sdrs Supplemental Retirement-\$4,015.00; Washington State Support Regis-\$115.38; Wellmark Blue Cross-\$124,887.93; Barnaud Law Firm-\$4,115.10; Black Hills Chemical-\$1,294.29; Black Hills Energy-\$13,345.37; Bluepeak-\$395.37; Bomgaars Supply-\$159.99; Butler Machinery Co-\$2,117.47; Cdw Government-\$688.00; Century Business Products-\$410.03; Clark Printing-\$91.59; Clauser Machine Works-\$540.00; Cornelius, Kaylee-\$60.00; Corr Construction Services-\$165,851.64; Creighton A Thurman-\$600.75; Delahoyde, Katy-\$98.00; Dustbusters-\$50,666.73; Great Western Tire-\$105.31; Hilpert & Hale Prof-\$871.46; Janke, Wendy-\$360.00; Jerry Greer's Engineering-\$1,141.96; John Deere Financial-\$121.48; Johner Gravel-\$10,636.81; Kimball-Midwest Co-\$314.40; Kosel, Joseph-\$6,715.35; Lawson Products-\$208.26; Lead, City Of-\$63.57; Lincoln County-\$580.50; Mabey, Brooke-\$180.00; Montana Dakota Utilities-\$2,271.02; Monument Health Network-\$11,906.75; Motorola Solutions-\$13,974.04; Nelson Law-\$331.70; Odp Business Solutions-\$132.52; On-Site First Aid & Safety-\$189.70; Patriot Fire & Safety-\$793.00; Pcsa Addiction Treatment-\$226.00; Percy, Melissa-\$480.00; Pharmchem-\$415.35; Pitney Bowes Global Financial-\$165.33; Pomp's Tire Service-\$244.80; Priority Dispatch-\$5,600.00; Queen City Rocket Lube-\$99.61; Quill-\$29.98; Radiology Associates-\$25.46; Res Construction-\$2,025,664.14; Ryan, Suzanne-\$60.00; S And S Repair-\$414.83; Schlingen Law Firm-\$1,266.00; Sd Dept Of Transportation-\$125,640.60; Simon North Region-\$408,062.57; Spearfish Auto Supply-\$2.16; Burdick, Laura-\$1,500.00; Sturdevant's Auto Parts-\$958.97; Summit Fire Protection-\$267.50; Sysco Montana-\$3,278.24; Twin City Hardware & Lumber-\$3,746.66; Us Armor Corporation-\$962.64; Wells Fargo Banks-\$151.88; White's Canyon Motors-\$2,212.84; **Witness & Jurors:** \$660.34.

ADJOURN: 12:08 p.m. There being no further business, Chairman Ewing adjourned the meeting.

Date Approved

Robert Ewing, Chairperson

ATTEST:

Brenda McGruder, Auditor